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State or political subdivision of a State 
or as may be necessary to provide serv-
ices to the individual. Information may 
be disclosed in summary, statistical, or 
other form, or for clinical or research 
purposes, but only if the disclosure 
does not identify particular individ-
uals.

§ 51b.405 What information is required 
in the application? 

(a) The initial application must in-
clude a description of the following: 

(1) The nature and extent of the vene-
real disease problem in the area. 

(2) The need for project grant sup-
port. 

(3) The immediate (1-year budget pe-
riod) and long-range (2–5 year project 
period) objectives of the project in spe-
cific and measurable terms. 

(4) The activities to be carried out to 
meet the objectives. The following pro-
gram elements must be included and 
described: 

(i) Venereal disease surveillance. 
(ii) Casefinding and case followup. 
(iii) Interstate epidemiologic referral 

and followup. 
(iv) Public venereal disease informa-

tion and education. 
(v) Professional (including appro-

priate allied health personnel) venereal 
disease education, training, and clin-
ical skills improvement activities, in-
cluding efforts to assure high quality 
clinical services in public venereal dis-
ease clinics. 

(5) At the option of the applicant, 
special studies or demonstrations to 
evaluate or test venereal disease pre-
vention and control strategies and ac-
tivities. 

(6) The manner in which the appli-
cant intends to conduct and evaluate 
the project, including a system for 
analysis of morbidity data so that con-
trol activities can be efficiently evalu-
ated and targeted. 

(7) The diagnostic and treatment 
services that will be provided. 

(8) A budget and justification for the 
grant funds requested. Since public in-
formation and education activities are 
authorized separately from other con-
trol program activities, funds re-
quested for this purpose must be 
itemized and justified separately in the 
narrative part of the application. 

(b) An application for a continuation 
grant must be submitted for each fund-
ing period. This continuation applica-
tion must include the following: 

(1) A budget and justification for the 
grant funds requested. 

(2) A summary of the progress 
achieved during the previous budget 
period. 

(3) A description of any changes in 
the information shown in the project 
application.

§ 51b.406 How will grant applications 
be evaluated and the grants award-
ed? 

(a) Within the limits of funds avail-
able, the Secretary may award a grant 
to assist in meeting the cost of a vene-
real disease control program. Before 
awarding a grant to a political subdivi-
sion of a State, the Secretary will con-
sult with the State health authority. 

(b) Priorities for funding will be 
based on the following factors: 

(1) The relative extent of the vene-
real disease problem in the area served 
by the applicant. 

(2) The design of the venereal disease 
prevention and control program. 

(3) The general quality of the appli-
cant’s plan of operation and objectives 
in accordance with the requirements in 
these regulations. Emphasis will be 
placed on determining the extent to 
which services are coordinated among 
health care providers in the area served 
and integrated into a cohesive plan for 
delivery of service to groups having the 
highest incidence of venereal disease. 

(4) The capacity of the applicant to 
make effective use of Federal funds. 

(5) The commitment of the applicant 
to the control of venereal disease as re-
flected in the commitment of applicant 
resources to the program.

§ 51b.407 How can grant funds be 
used? 

Grant funds awarded under this sub-
part may be used only for programs ap-
proved under section 318(c), and with 
respect to public information and edu-
cation, those programs approved under 
section 318(b) of the Act. Unless specifi-
cally approved, grant funds shall not be 
used for performing diagnostic tests 
(other than gonorrhea screening tests), 
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