
Winning Bidders BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
FEDERAL LAND TRANSACTION FACILITATION ACT

JUNE 15, 2005 ORAL AUCTION

Updated 6/16/2005

Parcel Number Gross Acres Fair Market Value Winning Bid Amt. Winning Bidder

N-78218 26.24                2,310,000$                    No Bid No Bid
N-78852 555.00              52,700,000$                  No Bid No Bid
N-78853 5.00                  275,000$                       425,000$                  Hamid Michael Mahban
N-78854 5.00                  275,000$                       420,000$                  Darrell Hammer
N-78855 2.50                  138,000$                       200,000$                  Hamid Michael Mahban
N-78856 2.50                  138,000$                       200,000$                  Cynthia Mirza
N-78857 2.50                  138,000$                       195,000$                  John Luther, II
N-78858 2.50                  138,000$                       195,000$                  Patrick Paoli
N-78859 2.50                  138,000$                       195,000$                  Philip Davis
N-78860 2.50                  138,000$                       210,000$                  Philip Davis
N-78861 2.50                  138,000$                       260,000$                  Philip Davis
N-78862 2.50                  138,000$                       275,000$                  Philip Davis
N-78863 5.00                  275,000$                       495,000$                  Philip Davis
N-78864 5.00                  275,000$                       600,000$                  Philip Davis
N-78865 1.25                  69,000$                         130,000$                  Cynthia Mirza
N-78866 1.25                  69,000$                         135,000$                  John Koster
N-78867 1.25                  69,000$                         120,000$                  Gordon Hardy
N-78868 1.25                  69,000$                         125,000$                  Robert Dale Beck
N-78869 1.25                  69,000$                         110,000$                  Rajwinder Dhaliwal
N-78870 1.25                  69,000$                         117,500$                  Harry Harvey Jr.
N-78871 1.25                  69,000$                         105,000$                  Douglas Soper
N-78872 1.25                  69,000$                         110,000$                  Cynthia Mirza
N-78873 1.25                  69,000$                         115,000$                  Mary & Gary Borges
N-78874 1.25                  69,000$                         130,000$                  Sean Reza Afshar
N-78875 1.25                  69,000$                         160,000$                  Edward Van Sloten
N-78876 1.25                  69,000$                         170,000$                  Jeffrey R. Yelland
N-78877 1.25                  69,000$                         150,000$                  Shoaib Tamim
N-78878 1.25                  69,000$                         125,000$                  William Berdie
N-78879 1.25                  69,000$                         137,500$                  Sean Reza Afshar
N-78880 1.25                  69,000$                         125,000$                  Jon L. Hadley
N-78881 1.25                  69,000$                         130,000$                  Ermilia Picking
N-78882 1.25                  69,000$                         130,000$                  Sean Reza Afshar
N-78883 1.25                  69,000$                         130,000$                  Louise Myers
N-78884 1.25                  69,000$                         165,000$                  Shoaib Tamim
N-78885 1.25                  69,000$                         200,000$                  Sean Reza Afshar
N-78886 1.25                  69,000$                         167,500$                  Sean Reza Afshar
N-78887 1.25                  69,000$                         172,500$                  Sean Reza Afshar
N-78888 1.25                  69,000$                         172,500$                  Sean Reza Afshar
N-78889 1.25                  69,000$                         135,000$                  James Hunter
N-78890 1.25                  69,000$                         140,000$                  James Hunter
N-78891 1.25                  69,000$                         125,000$                  Shane & Karen LaPier
N-78892 1.25                  69,000$                         130,000$                  Frank A. Phillips
N-78893 1.25                  69,000$                         187,500$                  Sean Reza Afshar
N-78894 1.25                  69,000$                         202,500$                  Sean Reza Afshar
N-78895 1.25                  69,000$                         194,000$                  Sean Reza Afshar

Note:  Final payment is due on the 180th day from the Sale - December 12, 2005.
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N-78896 1.25                  69,000$                         195,000$                  Sean Reza Afshar
N-78897 80.00                7,040,000$                    No Bid No Bid
N-78898 20.00                1,860,000$                    2,275,000$               Michael Costello
N-78899 5.00                  540,000$                       850,000$                  Nick Diakantonis
N-78900 50.00                5,150,000$                    5,150,000$               Thomas Griffin
N-78901 330.00              28,500,000$                  No Bid No Bid
N-78903 40.00                4,800,000$                    7,275,000$               Thomas Griffin
N-78904 20.00                2,280,000$                    3,450,000$               Thomas Griffin
N-78917 582.82              29,300,000$                  No Bid No Bid
N-78933 20.00                2,160,000$                    3,325,000$               Thomas Griffin
N-78934 202.59              8,700,000$                    No Bid No Bid
N-78935 2.90                  128,000$                       202,500$                  Paul Pawlik
N-78936 2.91                  127,000$                       170,000$                  Gordon Hardy
N-78937 2.90                  93,000$                         95,000$                    Lily Ripley
N-78938 2.90                  142,000$                       187,500$                  Rajwinder Dhaliwal
N-78939 2.92                  131,000$                       182,500$                  Gordon Hardy
N-78940 2.93                  117,000$                       153,000$                  Brooke Ann Mrofcza
N-78941 2.92                  131,000$                       161,000$                  Brooke Ann Mrofcza
N-78942 2.92                  88,000$                         92,000$                    Edward Dibble
N-78943 2.91                  131,000$                       160,000$                  Joseph Somario
N-78944 2.92                  131,000$                       167,000$                  Gordon Hardy
N-78945 2.91                  131,000$                       220,000$                  Denise Ware
N-78946 2.91                  160,000$                       200,000$                  Gordon Hardy
N-78947 2.90                  90,000$                         150,000$                  Gordon Hardy
N-78948 2.90                  131,000$                       170,000$                  Gordon Hardy
N-78949 2.90                  64,000$                         161,000$                  Joseph Somario
N-78950 2.89                  52,000$                         112,000$                  Melvin Cavanaugh

Total: 2,058.19           151,599,000$                33,220,000$             

Note:  Final payment is due on the 180th day from the Sale - December 12, 2005.


