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No Action/No Project Alternative—
The No Action/No Project Alternative 
represents the conditions that would 
occur at ONT without comprehensive 
Master Plan improvements. This 
alternative will not include any new 
facilities or improvements to existing 
facilities other than those that have 
independent utility, are unconnected 
actions to comprehensive Master Plan 
improvements and have (or are) 
undergoing separate environmental 
review. When forecasted operations are 
realized, current facilities would not 
provide an acceptable level of service to 
accommodate this increased passenger 
demand. 

Alternative 1—Linear expansion of 
existing passenger terminals and aircraft 
apron (gates) on the north side of the 
airport, relocation of both runways to 
the south and east to create additional 
terminal area circulation, separation of 
the runways and construction of a 
center taxiway between north and south 
runways to improve airfield efficiency 
and safety, construction of structured 
auto parking lots, construction/
expansion of terminal access roads, 
relocation and/or expansion of the 
existing ground transportation center, 
construction of additional economy 
parking lots, relocation and/or 
expansion of employee parking lot, 
expansion and/or relocation of general 
aviation facilities, expansion and/or 
relocation of airport maintenance area, 
construction and/or relocation of an 
airport administration facility, 
expansion/construction/relocation of 
aircraft safety facility (aircraft rescue 
and firefighting (ARFF) facility), impact 
to some existing south side facilities, an 
airport people mover (APM) system may 
be constructed, surface transportation 
improvements may be constructed, land 
acquisition of approximately 33 acres, 
construction of new parallel taxiways, 
relocation of existing parallel taxiways 
and construction/relocation of 
connector taxiways. 

Alternative 2—Linear expansion of 
the existing passenger terminals on the 
north side of the airport, construction of 
a passenger terminal on the south side 
of the airport, no relocation of runways, 
extension of south runway to the east, 
relocation of Taxiway S, construction of 
structured auto parking lots, 
construction/expansion of terminal 
access roads including new ground 
access facilities for the new south 
terminal, relocation and/or expansion of 
the existing ground transportation 
center, construction of additional 
economy parking lots, relocation and/or 
expansion of employee parking lot, 
expansion and/or relocation of general 

aviation facilities, expansion and/or 
relocation of airport maintenance area, 
construction and/or relocation of an 
airport administration facility, 
expansion/construction/relocation of 
aircraft safety facility (aircraft rescue 
and firefighting (ARFF) facility), an 
airport people mover (APM) system may 
be constructed, surface transportation 
improvements may be constructed, 
impact to many of the existing south 
side facilities and land acquisitions of 
approximately 220 acres. 

Comments and suggestions are invited 
from Federal, State and local agencies, 
and other interested parties to ensure 
that the full range of issues related to 
these proposed projects are addressed 
and all significant issues are identified. 
Written comments and suggestions 
concerning the scope of the EIS/EIR may 
be mailed to the FAA informational 
contact listed above and must be 
received no later than 5 p.m. Pacific 
Daylight Time, on Monday, September 
13, 2004. 

Public Scoping Meetings 
The FAA and LAWA will jointly hold 

one (1) public and one (1) governmental 
agency scoping meeting to solicit input 
from the public and various Federal, 
State and local agencies that have 
jurisdiction by law or have specific 
expertise with respect to any 
environmental impacts associated with 
the proposed projects. A scoping 
meeting specifically for governmental 
and public agencies will now be held on 
Tuesday, August 17, 2004, from 1 p.m. 
to 3 p.m., Pacific Daylight Time at the 
Ontario Convention Center, 2000 
Convention Center Way, Ontario, 
California 91764 (enter public parking 
lot off Holt Avenue). The public scoping 
meeting will be held at the same 
location on Tuesday, August 17, 2004, 
from 6 p.m. to 9 p.m. Pacific Daylight 
Time.

Issued in Hawthorne, California on Friday 
June 25, 2004. 
Mark A. McClardy, 
Manager, Airports Division, Western—Pacific 
Region, AWP–600.
[FR Doc. 04–15043 Filed 7–1–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4910–13–M

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

Federal Aviation Administration 

[Summary Notice No. PE–2004–50] 

Petitions for Exemption; Dispositions 
of Petitions Issued

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA), DOT.

ACTION: Notice of dispositions of prior 
petitions. 

SUMMARY: Pursuant to FAA’s rulemaking 
provisions governing the application, 
processing, and disposition of petitions 
for exemption part 11 of Title 14, Code 
of Federal Regulations (14 CFR), this 
notice contains the dispositions of 
certain petitions previously received. 
The purpose of this notice is to improve 
the public’s awareness of, and 
participation in, this aspect of FAA’s 
regulatory activities. Neither publication 
of this notice nor the inclusion or 
omission of information in the summary 
is intended to affect the legal status of 
any petition or its final disposition.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: John 
Linsenmeyer, Office of Rulemaking 
(ARM–1), Federal Aviation 
Administration, 800 Independence 
Avenue, SW., Washington, DC 20591. 
Tel. (202) 267–5174. 

This notice is published pursuant to 
14 CFR 11.85 and 11.91.

Issued in Washington, D.C., on June 24, 
2004. 
Anthony F. Fazio, 
Director, Office of Rulemaking.

Dispositions of Petitions 

Docket No.: FAA–2003–15527. 
Petitioner: Airbus. 
Section of 14 CFR Affected: 14 CFR 

25.812(b)(1)(i), 25.853, 25.855, 25.857, 
25.858 and 25.1439(a). 

Description of Relief Sought/
Disposition: Airbus seeks an extension 
of Exemption No. 8084 for 3 months. 
Exemption No. 8084 allows Airbus to 
install and operate lower deck mobile 
crew rests (LD–MCR) on Airbus Model 
A330 airplanes for 12 months from the 
date the exemption was issued. 

Grant of Exemption, 06/23/2004, 
Exemption No. 8084A 

Docket No.: FAA–2004–17212. 
Petitioner: Israel Aircraft Industries, 

Ltd. 
Section of 14 CFR Affected: 14 CFR 

25.813(b)(3), 25.857(e) and 
25.1447(c)(1). 

Description of Relief Sought/
Disposition: To allow carriage of two 
non-crewmembers (commonly referred 
to as supernumeraries) on Boeing Model 
737 airplanes converted from passenger 
to freighter configuration. 

Grant of Exemption, 06/03/2004, 
Exemption No. 8335 
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