
 

 

 
{W archiwum}  RE: agreement 

 
Tom Albertson   do: Przemyslaw Rawa 2013-10-18 20:48 

 
 

DW
: 

Elzbieta Wlodarczyk 

  

 

  
 
   
Od: Tom Albertson <tomalb@microsoft.com>  

   
Do: Przemyslaw Rawa <Przemyslaw.Rawa@kir.com.pl>,   

   
DW: Elzbieta Wlodarczyk <Elzbieta.Wlodarczyk@kir.com.pl>  

 
 
Archiwum:  Ta wiadomość jest wyświetlana w archiwum. 

 

{W archiwum} RE: agreement 

Tom Albertson  

do: 

Przemyslaw Rawa 

2013-10-18 20:48 

DW: 

Elzbieta Wlodarczyk 

Ukryj szczegóły  

Od: Tom Albertson <tomalb@microsoft.com> 

Do: Przemyslaw Rawa <Przemyslaw.Rawa@kir.com.pl>,  

DW: Elzbieta Wlodarczyk <Elzbieta.Wlodarczyk@kir.com.pl> 

Historia: Udzielono odpowiedzi na tę wiadomość i przesłano ją 

dalej. 

Archiwum: Ta wiadomość jest wyświetlana w archiwum. 

Good afternoon, 
 
The CA Agreement is on my director’s desk awaiting his signature – I expect him back in the office on 
Tuesday.  I will return a signed copy to you for your records as soon as he has signed it on this end. 
 
The KIR SA root certificate has passed testing and we will begin distribution later today and complete 
distribution in November. 
 
Today I will post the Certificate Trust List (CTL – the list including your root cert and all root certs 
distributed in the Program, available via the auto root update mechanism) to Windows Update, 
which enables automatic distribution of root certificates to users of Windows Vista and later.  You 
may begin to notice availability of your root certificate to your customers from WU servers in a few 
hours; however for users who have previously trusted your root (which may include most KIR 
employees), the actual distribution will begin within approximately one week, once the CRL cache 
resets (automatically every week).   
 
We will complete the root distribution in November, when we distribute the root update package 
(rootsupd.exe – containing your root cert and all root certs distributed in the Program) via Windows 
Update to users running Windows XP Service Pack 3.  The package is tentatively scheduled for 



distribution on November 12, and again it should be available to Windows XP users in a matter of a 
few hours, and historically most opt to install the update.   
 
For details on both CTL and root update package distribution see the section “How Windows Updates 
Root Certificates” in KB931125.   
 
Please keep in mind that we can never warrant distribution of any root update package, events 
outside our control can intervene which may cause of to postpone a scheduled distribution.  
Everything looks very good for the scheduled distribution now however.  I will send out another 
email once the root update package distribution is confirmed. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Tom Albertson, Program Manager 
Windows Root Certificate Program   
 
From: Przemyslaw Rawa [mailto:Przemyslaw.Rawa@kir.com.pl]  
Sent: Thursday, October 17, 2013 1:19 AM 
To: Tom Albertson 
Cc: Elzbieta Wlodarczyk 
Subject: agreement 

 
Hello,  
 
Could you give me an update on the status of our agreement? Is the distribution the KIR S.A. root 
certificate still valid in the November root update?  
 
Best regards,  
 
Przemysław Rawa  
Deputy Director  
Digital Signature Business Line  
rtm. W. Pileckiego 65  
02-781 Warsaw, Poland  
phone: (+48) 22 545 54 11  
fax: (+48) 22 545 55 99  
mobile: (+48) 603 305 097  
e-mail: przemyslaw.rawa@kir.com.pl  
 

 

 

 
Od:        Tom Albertson <tomalb@microsoft.com>  
Do:        Przemyslaw Rawa <Przemyslaw.Rawa@kir.com.pl>,  
Data:        2013-09-25 10:31  
Temat:        RE: agreement  

 
 

 

 

Good afternoon,  
   
I received your CA Agreement and its on my desk.  I’m in Turkey this week, returning to 
Redmond on Monday.  I’ll take the stack of CA Agreements and ask my Director to sign them 

http://support.microsoft.com/kb/931125
mailto:Przemyslaw.Rawa@kir.com.pl
mailto:przemyslaw.rawa@kir.com.pl
mailto:tomalb@microsoft.com
mailto:Przemyslaw.Rawa@kir.com.pl


when I return, then I’ll return a copy to you.  
   
Best Regards,  
Tom  

   
From: Przemyslaw Rawa [mailto:Przemyslaw.Rawa@kir.com.pl]  
Sent: Wednesday, September 25, 2013 9:47 AM 
To: Tom Albertson 
Subject: agreement  
   

Hello,  
 
Could you please let me know, if you have received the agreement we have sent on 
6th September? What is the status of the agreement?  

 
Thank you in advance for information.  
 
Best regards,  
 
Przemysław Rawa  
Deputy Director  
Digital Signature Business Line  
rtm. W. Pileckiego 65  
02-781 Warsaw, Poland  
phone: (+48) 22 545 54 11  
fax: (+48) 22 545 55 99  
mobile: (+48) 603 305 097  
e-mail: przemyslaw.rawa@kir.com.pl 

   

 
 

 
Krajowa Izba Rozliczeniowa S.A., ul. rtm. W. Pileckiego 65, 02-781 Warszawa, 
zarejestrowana w Sądzie Rejonowym dla m. st. Warszawy, XIII Wydział 
Gospodarczy Krajowego Rejestru Sądowego pod nr KRS 0000113064, NIP 526-030-
05-17, REGON 012105474, kapitał zakładowy i wpłacony 5.445.000 zł.  

 
 

 
Informacja zawarta w tej transmisji jest przeznaczona tylko dla osoby lub jednostki, 
do której jest adresowana. Może ona zawierać zastrzeżone i poufne informacje i 
jeżeli to nie Państwo są wskazanym odbiorcą, nie można kopiować, 
rozpowszechniać lub podejmować żadnych czynności w oparciu o nią. W przypadku 
otrzymania tej transmisji przez pomyłkę, proszę powiadomić nadawcę za pomocą 
emaila zwrotnego i usunąć tę transmisję (wraz z załącznikami) z Państwa systemu. 
 
 
The information contained in this transmission is intended only for the individual or 

mailto:Przemyslaw.Rawa@kir.com.pl
mailto:przemyslaw.rawa@kir.com.pl


entity to whom it is addressed. It may contain privileged and confidential information 
and if you are not an indicated recipient, you must not copy, distribute or take any 
action in reliance on it. If received in error, please notify the sender by return email 
and delete his transmission (and any attachments) from your system.  

   
 
 

 

 

 
 
Krajowa Izba Rozliczeniowa S.A., ul. rtm. W. Pileckiego 65, 02-781 Warszawa, zarejestrowana w Sądzie Rejonowym dla m. st. 
Warszawy, XIII Wydział Gospodarczy Krajowego Rejestru Sądowego pod nr KRS 0000113064, NIP 526-030-05-17, REGON 
012105474, kapitał zakładowy i wpłacony 5.445.000 zł. 

 
 
Informacja zawarta w tej transmisji jest przeznaczona tylko dla osoby lub jednostki, do której jest adresowana. Może ona zawierać 
zastrzeżone i poufne informacje i jeżeli to nie Państwo są wskazanym odbiorcą, nie można kopiować, rozpowszechniać lub podejmować 
żadnych czynności w oparciu o nią. W przypadku otrzymania tej transmisji przez pomyłkę, proszę powiadomić nadawcę za pomocą 
emaila zwrotnego i usunąć tę transmisję (wraz z załącznikami) z Państwa systemu. 
 
 
The information contained in this transmission is intended only for the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. It may contain 
privileged and confidential information and if you are not an indicated recipient, you must not copy, distribute or take any action in 
reliance on it. If received in error, please notify the sender by return email and delete his transmission (and any attachments) from your 
system.  

 

 


